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at the Medical School of the University of Athens and 
qualified as a doctor in 1992. Soon after, he trained as a 
plastic surgeon in both the United Kingdom and Greece, 
where he was also awarded with a PhD on skin cancer 
and melanoma. In 2001 he received the European Di-
ploma of Plastic, Reconstructive and Aesthetic surgery 
and Fellow of European Boards of Plastic Reconstruc-
tive and Aesthetic Surgery (FEBOPRAS). Over the years 
he’s been known for publishing and presenting several 
papers on plastic surgery resulting from his extensive re-
search in the field.

He is a renowned international speaker. Over the years 
he has participated in a large number of national and 
international plastic surgery conferences, often giving lec-
tures or serving as a moderator. In addition, he serves as 
International Inspector for the American Association for 
Accreditation for Ambulatory Surgery Facilities Interna-
tional (AAAASFI). 

Dr Metaxotos established Symmetria, a world-class an-
ti-aging institute meticulously designed with customer 
care and comfort in mind, in 2005. Symmetria became a 
state-of-the-art medical and beauty clinic awarded with 
the Best Clinic Award in 2015. Dr Metaxotos’ vision of 

creating an environment whereby individuals can come 
and receive elite services to improve their appearance 
soon became a very pragmatic reality not only for local 
but also for international visitors, who choose Symmetria 
for its high aesthetic standards, excellent reputation and 
advanced techniques in facial rejuvenation, non-invasive 
anti-aging techniques and body reshaping.

In 2013, the American Plastic Surgery Practice magazine 
hosted Dr. Metaxotos on its cover accompanied by an 
article pertaining to his success story. Furthermore, his 
work has also been highlighted in British TATLER maga-
zine and the Daily Mail.

Last but not least, Dr. Metaxotos cares greatly about giv-
ing back to the community as he is the founder of the I 
LIVE FOR ME non-profit organization for individuals 
battling cancer and other chronic diseases. Through his 
organization he conducts patient seminars, events and 
an application aimed at raising awareness in terms of 
introducing cancer-preventative measures, helping indi-
viduals already suffering from this disease as well as ad-
vising their family and friends. 


